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Prelude    Michele Smith 

 

“Holy Is the Lord” (67) 

“Holy, Holy, Holy” (68)  

“Agnus Dei” 
 

Prayer and Welcome   Patrick Hunter 

 

“Days of Elijah” (289) 

“Because He Lives” (449) 

“I Will Rise” (54) 
 

Message    Brother Patrick 

 

“Draw Me Close” (482) 

 

Closing Prayer 

 

 This is Us:  
Foundationally Accurate 

Psalm 18:31-32; 1 Corinthians 3:10-15; Matthew 21:42-44 
 
 

God is the Only                                                              .  
(Psalm 18:31-32) 

31For who is God, but the Lord? And who is a rock, ex-
cept our God?— 32the God who equipped me with 
strength and made my way blameless. Psalm 18:31-32 
ESV 

 
This Sure Foundation Provides                                         . 

(1 Corinthians 3:10-15) 
10According to the grace of God given to me, like a 
skilled master builder I laid a foundation, and someone 
else is building upon it. Let each one take care how he 
builds upon it. 11For no one can lay a foundation other 
than that which is laid, which is Jesus Christ. 12Now if an-
yone builds on the foundation with gold, silver, precious 
stones, wood, hay, straw— 13each one's work will be-
come manifest, for the Day will disclose it, because it will 
be revealed by fire, and the fire will test what sort of 
work each one has done. 14If the work that anyone has 
built on the foundation survives, he will receive a reward. 
15If anyone's work is burned up, he will suffer loss, 
though he himself will be saved, but only as through fire. 
1 Corinthians 3:10-15 ESV 

 
Your Response                                          Your Direction.  

(Matthew 21:42-44) 
42Jesus said to them, “Have you never read in the Scrip-
tures: “‘The stone that the builders rejected has become 
the cornerstone; this was the Lord's doing, and it is mar-
velous in our eyes’? 43Therefore I tell you, the kingdom of 
God will be taken away from you and given to a people 
producing its fruits. 44And the one who falls on this stone 
will be broken to pieces; and when it falls on anyone, it 
will crush him.” Matthew 21:42-44 ESV 

For the word of God is living and active, sharper than 

any two-edged sword, piercing to the division of soul and 

of spirit, of joints and of marrow, and discerning the 

thoughts and intentions of the heart.  Hebrews 4:12 ESV 

**Offerings will be received by 

placing them in the offering box 

at the rear of the sanctuary    

before or after the service.** 


